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57 ABSTRACT 
Audio subliminal recordings are made in which in addi 
tion to using a primary carrier, such as music, two audio 
channels are used to deliver subliminal messages to the 
brain. On one channel, accessing the left brain hemi 
sphere, the message delivered is meaningfully spoken, 
forward-masked, permissive affirmations delivered in a 
round-robin manner by a male voice, a female voice and 
a child's voice. On the other channel, accessing the 
right brain, directive messages, in the same voices, are 
recorded in backward-masked (or meta-contrast). The 
three voices are recording in round-robin fashion with 
full echo reverberation. The audio tracks are mixed 
using a special processor which converts sound fre 
quencies to electrical impulses and tracks the subliminal 
message to synchronize the subliminal message in stereo 
with the primary carrier. The processor maintains con 
stant gain differential between the primary carrier and 
the subliminal verbiage and, with the subliminal ver 
biage being recorded with round-robin, full echo rever 
beration, ensures that none of a message is lost. The 
primary carrier should be continuous music without 
breaks or great differences in movements. 

48 Claims, 14 Drawing Sheets 
  



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 1 of 14 5,170,381 

A 
mas a mammam a momenon 

B 

TAPE-1 a GO 
PAY HEAD C C 

s-axis (3) 

of carries w R-CH 

n : 
.. (2) 

E 

F 

G 

() 
TAPE-2 C 

R/P HEAD (2) 

(3) 
H 

FG-1A 

  



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 2 of 14 5,170,381 

MC JACK 

LeCH 

J2 
R-CH 

  



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 3 of 14 5,170,381 

AD 

B. 

/2 (9 
22A 

C 

OFF 

D () DOLBY SW &n 
22B 

E 

F AC 

G V AB 

22C AA 

I 

NC 

Q12 
SWITCH 

J 

Z. 

U Y. W. W X Y 

FG-1C 



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 4 of 14 5,170,381 

U A W. W X Y 

D S2 w AF 
AG 

O D AH 

|| 

III Al 
P TTTTTTTTT 

| | | | Q H. 
R PIT 

AU AT AS AR AQAP AO 

FG-1D 



- U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 5 of 14 5,170,381 

al l 
O--- - 

CD d O O 2 

: 9 3 || Q 
N 
s 

e 

  

  

  



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 6 of 14 5,170,381 

AY 
-H am -m-, - Hamm . Hip 
AE 

AZ 

AD L102 BA 

AC 

AB 

AA 

8-65-64)-3-(2-1)-(10-G) 
- 

(p-2-3-(9-(5)-3-(2-3) 

Z. o wi 
loo 

AF GS) (4) 
2O2 BH BG 

B B 

FG-1 F 

  

  



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 7 of 14 5,170,381 

BJ. BI BH BG BK 
BL 

BM 

BN 

BO 

BP 

BQ 
BR 

BS 

BT 

S9 SO S11 
TAPE-1 TAPE-1 TAPE-1 
TAPE PLAY MOTOR SW 
SELECT 

(NORMAL) 

FG-1 G 

  



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 8 of 14 5,170,381 

- CE 

CF 

C- l CG 

CH 

it 
BE 

-1/ 

4- - - , 

1. CJ 



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 9 of 14 5,170,381 

  



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 10 of 14 5,170,381 

D 
d 

minimum tE 
C 

a) 
> 

| 

ga re 

O... I 
5 

s 

d 

g SA -W-e- 
Sa QIZ) S - 
O va 

d < C2 
s A l 
9 III H 
S H H -gs 

H-5 
e 
A 

2 

es 

5 As V : E. 



U.S. Patent Dec. 8, 1992 Sheet 11 of 14 5,170,381 

.D . 
st st Y 
d O 

Y X OO v LL 

CO O 'O % - 2 
> 2. l 
d O as 

a; 
A C 

s Q 
-17 d 

A 
A 

- 
e 
A H 

Tw. ITT. at with his A 

A | 

S is i 
o 
/ 
Cs 

) H 
O T es 2 oz 

|||| ins m O 

cN H O c.1.2t 
to O s 

d de X-N 
A a fa ES5 1. 

d 



Sheet 12 of 14 5,170,381 Dec. 8, 1992 U.S. Patent 

09090909 
  

  





5,170,381 Sheet 14 of 14 Dec. 8, 1992 

CO 

U.S. Patent 

48 

3. W ! 

  



5,170,381 
1 

METHOD FOR MIXING AUDIO SUBLIMINAL 
RECORDINGS 

This application relates to a method and apparatus for 
mixing audio subliminal recordings, and more particu 
larly to a method and apparatus for mixing audio sub 
liminal recording using a hemispheric approach to send 
messages to the brain. 

BACKGROUND OF THE INVENTION 

It is a well-known fact that in a very real sense every 
human being has two brains, what is termed in everyday 
speech as a right brain and a left brain, which are actu 
ally the right and left hemispheres of the human brain. 
For the vast majority of people, the left brain hemi 
sphere is in charge of such things as mathematical and 
language skills while the right brain hemisphere is the 
creative and emotional center. The left hemisphere is 
the logic and reason center with defense mechanisms 
such as rationalization built around logic and reason. 
The right hemisphere, in contrast, is indiscriminate. 
Most researchers relate logic and conscious reasoning 
to the left hemisphere and emotional and subconscious 
processes to the right hemisphere. 

It is thought that the left hemisphere is interested in 
literal correctness while the right hemisphere is more 
interested in overall associations and relationships. It is 
believed that the left hemisphere views language liter 
ally and according to the rules of language while the 
right brain views language spatially and emotionally, 
tumbling the words in a process called "subconscious 
cerebration' and even hearing the words as our eyes see 
the world . . . upside down. 

It has been proposed to utilize the way the brain 
functions by sending the brain subliminal messages. 
These messages seem to appeal directly to the emotions, 
causing behavior to override reason. Subliminal mes 
Sages can be sent either visually or audibly. 

In the instance of audio subliminal delivery using 
audio tapes, a subliminal message can be defined as a 
verbal stimulus perceived below the threshold of the 
listener's awareness. Perception in this instance refers to 
the process of stimuli acknowledged or registered at 
some level below the threshold of awareness (con 
sciousness). In order for perception by an individual to 
occur, there must be sufficient stimuli to trigger a neu 
ron in the brain. This is to differentiate from the situa 
tion where the message is not only below the threshold 
of awareness but also is not even perceived, such as a 
whisper two blocks away from the listener. 

In audio subliminal presentation, spoken words are 
injected beneath a primary carrier. A listener does not 
consciously hear the spoken words because they are 
concealed in "white' sound, such as the sound of wind 
or water, or they are concealed psychoaccoustically in 
or beneath music. Nevertheless, if appropriately done 
and the spoken words are not just substantially lowered 
in volume as compared to the volume of the primary 
carrier, the stimuli from the spoken words are regis 
tered by the listener. 
For the sake of an analogy, imagine that the verbal 

subliminal stimulus rides beneath the waves of nature 
sounds and music in the same manner as a submarine 
rides beneath the waves that are on the surface of the 
ocean. The outer ear catches the sounds (both the sur 
face waves and everything riding thereunder) as they 
enter the auditory canal. From the auditory canal, the 
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waves are transmitted to the drum membrane, or middle 
ear, where air pressure and three small bones convey 
vibrations to the inner ear. Within the inner ear are 
cochlea, or coiled structures, with sensory cells that 
receive the sound stimuli and transmit to the brain im 
pulses arising from the sound stimuli. The stimuli ulti 
mately trigger neurons in the brain. Millions of neurons 
are carrying message units triggered by stimuli across 
the synapses in the brain and each of these messages is 
simultaneously competing for conscious attention. 
Neurons do not have neutral states; they are either off 

or on. The threshold of awareness, or "perception 
level", that exists and is taking place below that thresh 
old is in fact a neural excitation. Without neural excita 
tion, there can be no perception. Research into brain 
wave activity has confirmed that an increase in pattern 
activity exists in test subjects who listened to music 
containing subliminal messages as compared to test 
subjects listening to the same music without subliminal 
messages. 
The nuances of audio subliminal presentations are 

widely varied. One process involves "time-compress 
ing' the verbal message by either speeding up the 
human voice to a high-pitched squeal or by digitally 
compressing the words, which involves removing the 
spacing between the sounds which results in one contin 
uous noise. 
Another method is known as "multifrequency state 

ments' which involves taking separate messages and 
overlaying them on different frequencies, then playing 
all these multi-frequency messages at the same time. 
Often these multi-frequency messages are recorded at 
frequencies that an ordinary cassette player cannot re 
produce. Audiologists believe such multifrequency 
messages are imperceptible to humans. 

In contrast to these two exotic methods of subliminal 
message delivery, there are a number of popular and 
proven methods for delivering verbal subliminal stin 
uli. One is the concealing of straightforward statements. 
Another is known as back-masking or metacontrast. A 
third uses both simultaneously. 

In the method of sending subliminal messages known 
as metacontrast or back-masking, the subliminal mes 
sages are recorded in reverse. When subliminal mes 
sages are sent to the brain in a reverse or played-back 
ward mode, the subliminal messages appear to excite 
emotional expressions and responses often viewed as 
right brain hemisphere in their origin. It is suspected 
that "heavy metal' recordings have used this process to 
send satanic, drug or sexual messages to the brain of the 
listener. 
Apparently, the first of the subliminal tracking mixers 

was developed by Professor Hal Becker of Tulane Uni 
versity in the 1970's. Becker's device, known simply as 
the "black box', was used to mix spoken words with 
Muzak. Becker's device was monaural and was tested in 
a supermarket in New Orleans during 1979. The black 
box mixed the words "Thou shall not steal' and "Hon 
esty is the best policy' into the Muzak system broadcast 
throughout the store. This test reportedly achieved a 
substantial lowering of cash shortages, inventory dam 
age and pilferage. 
The electronic mixing of the music (the primary car 

rier) and the verbal message (the subliminal message) 
helps ensure a constant signal differential between the 
two. It is believed that the constant signal differential is 
critical to the effectiveness of the brain registering the 
subliminal process. 
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It is an object of the present invention to provide a 
method of recording audio subliminal tapes that injects 
the subliminal verbiage beneath the primary carrier in a 
manner so that the subliminal verbiage is recoverable 
(i.e. the presence of the subliminal verbiage on the audio 5 
tape is verifiable by electronic means). 

It is a feature of the present invention that the sublimi 
nal verbiage is injected onto an audio tape beneath the 
level of the primary carrier at a constant gain differen 
tial to ensure effective brain registration of the sublimi- 10 
nal verbiage. 

It is an advantage of the present invention that the 
subliminal verbiage injected beneath the primary car 
rier is effectively perceived by the brain and that the 
subliminal verbiage is recoverable. 15 

It is a further object of the present invention to pro 
vide apparatus for recording recoverable subliminal 
verbiage beneath a primary carrier at a constant gain 
differential. 

It is a further feature of the present invention that an 20 
apparatus is provided that injects subliminal verbiage 
beneath a primary carrier onto an audio tape combining 
both forward-masked and backward-masked (or meta 
contrast) verbiage, including full echo reverberation 
and round robin verbiage along with multiple voice 25 
characteristics. 

It is an advantage of the present invention that the 
apparatus produces a subliminal audio tape recording 
having recoverable subliminal verbiage which is effec 
tively perceived by the brain. P 30 

SUMMARY OF THE INVENTION 

The present invention utilizes what is to be called the 
"whole-brain" approach. In the whole-brain approach, 
in addition to using a primary carrier, such as music, 35 
two audio channels are used to deliver subliminal mes 
sages to the brain. On one channel, accessing the left 
brain hemisphere, the message delivered is meaning 
fully spoken or sung; forward-masked, permissive affir 
mations delivered in a round-robin manner by a male 40 
voice, a female voice and a child's voice. Research has 
shown that particular individuals respond more favor 
ably to either a male voice, a female voice or a child's 
voice depending on the listener's preference. On the 
other channel, accessing the right brain, directive mes- 45 
sages, in the same voices, are recorded in backward 
masked (or metacontrast). Since the hemispheres are 
task oriented, both the right brain hemisphere and the 
left brain hemisphere become involved according to 
their individual specialties. 
A couple of other nuances may be added. The three 

voices are recorded in round-robin fashion with full 
echo reverberation. Split brain studies demonstrate that 
both the left and right brain hemispheres respond with 
identification ability to words that are sung. When 55 
words are spoken, there are hemispheric limitations that 
limit the ability of the brain to fully identify and con 
prehend the words. Further, accelerated learning meth 
ods indicate an advantage to the round robin method of 
communication. The audio tracks are mixed using a 60 
special processor which converts sound frequencies to 
electrical impulses and tracks the subliminal message to 
synchronize the subliminal message in stereo with the 
primary carrier. 
The processor, to be known as a PAR processor, 65 

maintains constant gain differential between the pri 
mary carrier and the subliminal verbiage and, with the 
subliminal verbiage being recorded with round-robin, 

50 

4. 
full echo reverberation, ensures that none of a message 
is lost. 

It is also possible to use as the primary carrier contin 
uous music withoutbreaks or great differences in move 
ments; or; to combine what is known as "white' or 
"pink" sound, such as ocean surf, with the music. The 
duration of the breaks in the music must be quite small 
or the effect of the subliminal messages can be altered. 
BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF THE DRAWINGS 

FIGS. 1A-1K show in schematic one of the master 
audio tape recording decks used in the system of the 
present invention. 

FIG. 2 shows in schematic one of the automatic track 
mixers of the present invention that mixes the primary 
carrier with the subliminal verbiage at a constant gain 
differential. 

FIG. 3 shows in schematic the time delay circuit used 
in the system of the present invention. 

FIG. 4 shows in schematic the circuitry for one of the 
tri-color LED indicators used in the system of the pres 
ent invention. 

FIG. 5 shows in schematic the power supply used in 
the system of the present invention. 

DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF THE 
PREFERRED EMBODEMENTS 

The initial step is the selection of both the primary 
carrier and the subliminal verbiage that will be com 
bined to create an audio subliminal recording. 

In the preferred embodiment, the primary carrier 
comprises soothing nature sounds, such as the sound of 
continuous ocean waves. It is also preferred to use in 
strumental-only music or to combine such music with 
the nature sounds. The main criteria is that there should 
be few, if any, breaks in the primary carrier since the 
main function of the primary carrier is to hide the ver 
biage that is being used to convey the subliminal mes 
Sage. 
Also in the preferred embodiment, the subliminal 

message is selected according to certain criteria. For 
example, positive affirmations in short, compact state 
ments are preferred. If the object of the subliminal mes 
sage is self-improvement, statements such as "I apply 
my best" or "I am successful" are used. If the object of 
the subliminal message is forgiveness, statements such 
as "I forgive myself” or "I am forgiven" or "I forgive 
all others' are used. 
Also in the preferred embodiment, each such state 

ment is recorded in three different types of voices, such 
as a man's voice, a woman's voice and a child's voice. In 
the preferred embodiment, a man's voice is considered 
to be generally in the range of 540-560 Hz., a woman's 
voice is considered to be generally in the range of 
1000-1050 Hz. and a child's voice is considered to be 
generally in the range of 950-1030 Hz. This combina 
tion of voices in used because listeners tend to respond 
more favorably to some voice types than to others. The 
verbiage can either be spoken, sung or a combination of 
the two since some people respond better to spoken 
words while others respond better to singing. 
An initial recording, usually on tape, is prepared 

containing the words that will be the subliminal ver 
biage. Each statement is recorded first in a man's voice, 
then followed by the same statement in a woman's voice 
and finally in a child's voice. This same statement may 
then be repeated or different statements interspersed, 
each recorded in the three different voices. 
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The initial verbiage that will eventually become the 
subliminal message on the resulting recording is input 
ted using the audio mixing device shown in FIG. 2. In 
the mixing device, the signals from two play heads are 
played on a first play device, referred to for conve 
nience as Deck #2, and sent through the mixer for 
further processing. Each play head is loaded with a 
prerecorded tape having the same verbiage. One of the 
play heads plays the verbiage in forward play, which 
will become for example the left channel of the resulting 
recording, and this verbiage functions as the forward 
masked subliminal verbiage in the resulting recording. 
The other play head plays the verbiage in backward 
mode which will become the right channel of the result 
ing recording, and this verbiage is sent through the 
system for further processing in this backward mode (or 
metacontrast). When these channels are ultimately re 
combined, the resulting recording has the same message 
in both forward and backward mode, but on different 
channels of the tape. 

In addition to this combined forward and backward 
mixing, three separate play devices may be used-re 
ferred to for convenience as Deck i2, Deck #1 and 
Deck #3. Deck #1 plays the same verbiage as Deck #2, 
but with a one second time delay. Deck #3 plays the 
same verbiage as Deck #2, but with a two second time 
delay. All three decks play the same verbiage both in 
forward and backward mode. When the signals are 
combined in the mixer, the result is a round robin effect 
of the verbiage due to the one and two second time 
delays of the three decks playing the verbiage. 
The left channel of verbiage is all in forward mode 

and the right channel of the verbiage is in backward or 
metacontrast mode. Whether forward or backward, 
each channel has the same message in round robin effect 
with repeating man, woman and child voices. If desired, 
full echo reverberation can be electronically added to 
each channel to prolong the reinforcement of the mes 
sage contained in the verbiage. 

This subliminal message in two channels-the left 
channel in forward mode and the right channel in back 
ward mode-is then mixed individually with the pri 
mary carrier to effect the masking of the subliminal 
message. The mixing of the subliminal message with the 
primary carrier is done using the circuitry shown sche 
matically in FIG. 2. 
As shown in FIG. 2, the signal from the primary 

carrier is first sampled for its gain level. By using a 
variable resistor, the gain level of the primary signal is 
sampled and the subliminal message signal that is to be 
injected into the primary carrier is adjusted or varied to 
be a constant gain differential from the gain level of the 
primary carrier. In the preferred embodiment, this gain 
differential is set so that the primary carrier is generally 
within no more than 20 Db above the gain level of the 
secondary verbiage or subliminal message signal. In the 
most preferred embodiment the gain differential is set so 
that the primary carrier is approximately between 3 Db 
and 5 Db above the gain level of the secondary verbiage 
or subliminal message signal. 
The adjusted primary carrier signal and the sublimi 

nal message signal are then combined and distributed 
through any suitable distribution means, such as an 
audio speaker or through distribution preamplifiers for 
ultimate recording on an audio tape recording device or 
other suitable recording means as shown in FIG. 2. 
FIGS. 1A-1K shows in schematic the dual tape deck 

used in the system of the present invention. This tape 
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6 
deck is a modification of a dual tape deck made by the 
Tandy Corporation, National Parts Dept., Fort Worth, 
Tex. 76101 and sold as Model # SCT-45-METAL. The 
Tandy dual tape deck is a conventional tape deck which 
has been modified to suit the purposes of the present 
invention. 
The operation of the modified dual tape deck of the 

present invention will now be described in connection 
with explaining the modifications that have been made 
to the Tandy dual tape deck. A prerecorded tape con 
taining the desired subliminal messages that will be 
injected as forward masked secondary signals under the 
primary signal is placed in Tape-1 Play Head and a 
prerecorded tape containing the desired subliminal mes 
sages that will be injected as backward mode or meta 
contrast secondary signals under the primary signal is 
placed in Tape-2 Play Head (both shown in FIG. 1A). 
The prerecorded tape placed in Tape-2 Play Head has 
the message originally recorded in forward mask mode 
and one of the modifications made is to reverse the tape 
heads on the Tape-2 Play Head so that the prerecorded 
tape played on this head is played backward to provide 
the backward masking or metacontrast that is to be 
injected or placed on the resulting subliminal recording. 
The signal coming from each channel of Tape-1 Play 
Head and Tape-2 Play Head is pre-amplified and sent 
through a variable resistor 22A, 22B, 22C and 22D, 
respectively (shown in FIG. 1C) for individual gain 
control. This individual gain control is done manually 
by the operator using the LED indicator circuitry 
shown in FIG. 4. 

After each signal has been individually adjusted to 
the proper gain, which in the preferred embodiment is 
generally within 1 Db of the other signals coming from 
the other play heads in the tape deck, the signal passes 
through a Dolby noise reduction circuit shown in FIG. 
1F and then pre-amplified for mixing with the primary 
signal. 
One of the other modifications made to the Tandy 

dual tape deck is that the recording ability of the deck is 
disabled since the dual tape deck of the present inven 
tion is used as a playback unit only. The dubbing capa 
bility is also disabled for the same reason. Finally, the 
tape select switch is modified to become the time delay 
circuit as will be explained below. 

FIG. 2 shows in schematic the automatic track mixer 
of the present invention that mixes the primary carrier 
signal with the subliminal verbiage signal at a constant 
gain differential. As discussed above, the primary signal 
is soothing nature sounds, such as the sound of continu 
ous ocean waves. It is also preferred to use instrumen 
tal-only music or to combine such music with the nature 
sounds. 
As shown in FIG. 2, the primary signal is first contin 

uously sampled to determine its gain level. The second 
ary signal is continuously combined with the primary 
signal at a constant gain differential such that the sec 
ondary signal is preferably kept generally no more than 
20 Db below the gain level of the primary signal and in 
the most preferred embodiment approximately between 
3 Db-5 Db below the level of the primary signal. This 
prevents the secondary signal from being consciously 
audible to the listener. The resulting combined signal 
can then be sent to any one or all of a plurality of output 
devices such as speakers 40 or through pre-amplifiers 50 
for tape recorders (not shown) to make the resulting 
subliminal audio recording. 
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As discussed above, in the preferred embodiment, the 
resulting subliminal audio recording has a channel of 
forward masked verbiage and a channel of backward 
masked or metacontrast verbiage. Each channel prefer 
ably has three distinct voices-male, female and chil 
d-repeating the message in round robin effect with full 
echo reverberation. As will be described, this is 
achieved by using various multiples of the apparatus 
shown in FIGS. 1A-1K and FIG, 2. 
Three separate dual tape decks, each of the type 

shown in FIGS. 1A-1K and identified as Deck #1, 
Deck #2 and Deck #3, are electronically connected 
together. One of these tape decks, for example Deck 
#2, is provided with the Time Delay Switch Circuit 
shown in FIG. 3 (and also shown at 30 in FIG. 1G). 
Each of Deck #1, Deck #2 and Deck #3 are provided 
with two prerecorded tapes, one placed in Tape-1 Play 
Head and one placed in Tape-2 Play Head, containing 
the verbiage that will be injected onto the primary 
carrier. Each of Deck #1, Deck #2 and Deck i3 has 
one of its tape heads (preferably Tape-2 Play Head) 
reversed so that one of the verbiage tapes will be in 
jected in backward masked or metacontrast mode. 

In addition to the three separate dual tape decks, two 
separate automatic track mixers are used of the type 
shown in FIG. 2, identified as the Left Mixer and the 
Right Mixer, since each mixer handles separately all the 
left channel outputs and the right channel outputs, re 
spectively, from each tape deck. 

In operation, after all six of the prerecorded tapes are 
loaded into the respective Play Heads, the operator 
activates the system by closing the Time Delay Switch 
30 on Deck #2. Deck #2 is activated first and functions 
as described above. The closing of the Time Delay 
Switch also activates the Time Delay Circuit shown in 
FIG. 3. This circuit sends power from the Power Sup 
ply to Deck #1 on a one second time delay and then 
sends power from the Power Supply to Deck #3 after 
another one second time delay. This delay results in the 
verbiage from Deck #1 and Deck #2 and Deck #3 
being injected onto the primary signal in a round robin 
and full echo reverberation mode-like what a person 
would hear if he were listening to verbiage being spo 
ken or sung in round robin. 
The outputs from Deck #1, Deck #2 and Deck #3 

are sent to one of the two automatic track mixers-all of 
the three left channel outputs are sent to the Left Mixer 
and all of the three right channel outputs are sent to the 
Right Mixer. These three combined signals, forming the 
round robin effect, are what is injected as the secondary 
signal onto the primary carrier as shown in FIG. 2. 
After the automatic track mixer injects the secondary 
signal onto the primary carrier maintaining the appro 
priate decibel spacing (preferably not more than 20 Db 
below the level of the primary signal and most prefera 
bly approximately between 3 Db and 5 Db below the 
level of the primary carrier), the resulting combined 
signal is recorded on the appropriate track (left or right) 
of the resulting subliminal audio recording. This results 
in the primary signal being recorded in stereo providing 
a very pleasant recording and one that is easy to listen 
tO. 

FIG. 4 shows in schematic the circuitry for the tri 
color LED indicator used in the system of the present 
invention. A tri-color LED indicator is attached to each 
of the variable resistors 22 shown in FIG. A. The 
operator watches the gain level of the signal coming 
from the play head and manually adjusts the gain level 
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8 
to set the gain level within the desired decibel range as 
compared to the other gain levels coming from the 
other play heads. In the preferred embodiment, the gain 
levels of the various signals coming from the individual 
play heads should not vary by more than generally one 
decibel. Rather than having to watch numerical meters, 
the tri-color LED indicator circuit will illuminate a 
green light when the particular play head is within one 
decibel of the desired reference level. If the gain level 
falls more than one decibel below the desired reference 
level, the LED is illuminated with a red light alerting 
the operator that the gain level is too low so that manual 
adjustment can be made. Similarly, if the gain level rises 
more than one decibel above the desired reference 
level, the LED is illuminated with a yellow light alert 
ing the operator that the gain level is too high so that 
manual adjustment can be made. In the preferred em 
bodiment having Deck #1, Deck #2 and Deck #3, it 
will be necessary to have twelve of the tri-color LED 
indicator circuits shown in FIG. 4 since each Deck has 
four play heads. 

FIG. 5 shows in schematic the power supply used in 
the system of the present invention. In the preferred 
embodiment, the entire three Deck, two Mixer and 
twelve tri-color LED indicator circuits are operated 
from a 120 V AC transformer having a 25 V center top. 
The transformer and accompanying circuit shown in 
FIG. 5 provides a 12 V power supply to each of the 
three decks and the attendant peripheral circuits shown 
in the other Figures. While the invention has been illus 
trated with respect to several specific embodiments 
thereof, these embodiments should be considered as 
illustrative rather than limiting. Various modifications 
and additions may be made and will be apparent to 
those skilled in the art. Accordingly, the invention 
should not be limited by the foregoing description, but 
rather should be defined only by the following claims. 
What is claimed is: 
1. A method of making audio subliminal recordings 

comprising: 
a) selecting a sound to be used as a primary carrier, 
b) selecting verbiage to be injected beneath the pri 
mary carrier as a subliminal message, 

c) recording a first statement on a first channel in 
forward masking form and recording a second 
statement on a second channel in back-masking 
form, 

d) combining the first statement on the first channel 
with the second statement on the second channel to 
create the subliminal message, 

e) mixing the primary carrier sound with the sublimi 
nal message to maintain the volume level of the 
subliminal message within a constant decibel range 
beneath the volume level of the primary carrier 
sound, 

f) recording the mixed primary carrier sound and the 
subliminal message whereby an audio subliminal 
recording is created. 

2. The method of claim 1 wherein the constant deci 
bel range is generally not more than 20 Db. 

3. The method of claim 1 wherein the constant deci 
bel range is not more than approximately 3 to 5 DB. 

4. The method of claim 1 wherein the verbiage com 
prising the first statement is in the form of a positive 
affirmation and the verbiage comprising the second 
statement is in the form of a directive message. 

5. The method of claim 4 wherein the forward mask 
ing statement is a round robin message. 
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6. The method of claim 5 wherein the round robin 
message is a three repeat cycle. 

7. The method of claim 6 wherein each three repeat 
cycle comprises a man's voice, a woman's voice and a 
child's voice. 

8. The method of claim 7 wherein the forward mask 
ing is in full echo reverberation. 

9. The method of claim 4 wherein the forward mask 
ing is in full echo reverberation. 

10. The method of claim 4 wherein the back-masking 
statement is a round robin message. 

11. The method of claim 10 wherein the round robin 
message is a three repeat cycle. 

12. The method of claim 11 wherein each three repeat 
cycle comprises a man's voice, a woman's voice and a 
child's voice. 

13. The method of claim 12 wherein the back-mask 
ing is in full echo reverberation. 

14. The method of claim 11 wherein the back-mask 
ing is in full echo reverberation. 

15. The method of claim 4 wherein both the forward 
masking statement and the back masking statement are 
a round robin message. 

16. The method of claim 15 wherein the round robin 
message is a three repeat cycle. 

17. The method of claim 16 wherein each three repeat 
cycle comprises a man's voice, a woman's voice and a 
child's voice. 

18. The method of claim 17 wherein both the forward 
masking and the back-masking are in full echo reverber 
at On. 

19. The method of claim 15 wherein both the forward 
masking and the back-masking are in full echo reverber 
at10. 

20. An audio subliminal recording made by the 
method of claim 15. 

21. An audio subliminal recording made by the 
method of claim 4. 

22. The method of claim 1 wherein the forward mask 
ing and the back-masking messages are different ver 
biage. 

23. The method of claim 1 wherein both the forward 
masking and the back-masking messages are the same 
verbiage. 

24. An audio subliminal recording made by the 
method of claim 1. 

25. A method of making audio subliminal recordings 
comprising: 

a) selecting a sound to be used as a primary carrier, 
b) selecting verbiage to be injected at a lower volume 

level beneath the volume level of the sound of the 
primary carrier as a subliminal message, 

c) recording a first statement on a first channel in 
forward masking form and recording a second 
statement on a second channel in back-masking 
form, 

d) combining the first statement on the first channel 
with the second statement on the second channel to 
create the subliminal message, 

e) continuously sampling the volume level of the 
sound of the primary carrier, 

f) continuously adjusting the volume level of the 
subliminal message verbiage to maintain the vol 
ume level of the subliminal message verbiage 
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within a constant decibel range below the volume 
level of the sound of the primary carrier, 

g) mixing the primary carrier sound with the sublimi 
nal message verbiage, 

h) recording the mixed primary carrier sound and the 
subliminal message whereby an audio subliminal 
recording is created. 

26. The method of claim 25 wherein the constant 
decibel range is generally not more than 20 Db. 

27. The method of claim 25 wherein the constant 
decibel range is not more than approximately 3 to 5 DB. 

28. The method of claim 25 wherein the verbiage 
comprising the first statement is in the form of a positive 
affirmation and the verbiage comprising the second 
statement is in the form of a directive message. 

29. The method of claim 28 wherein the forward 
masking is in full echo reverberation. 

30. The method of claim 28 wherein the back-mask 
ing statement is a round robin message. 

31. The method of claim 30 wherein the round robin 
message is a three repeat cycle. 

32. The method of claim 31 wherein each three repeat 
cycle comprises a man's voice, a woman's voice and a 
child's voice. 

33. The method of claim 32 wherein the back-mask 
ing is in full echo reverberation. 

34. The method of claim 31 wherein the back-mask 
ing is in full echo reverberation. 

35. The method of claim 28 wherein both the forward 
masking statement and the back masking statement are 
a round robin message. 

36. An audio subliminal recording made by the 
method of claim 35. 

37. The method of claim 35 wherein the round robin 
message is a three repeat cycle. 

38. The method of claim 37 wherein each three repeat 
cycle comprises a man's voice, a woman's voice and a 
child's voice. 

39. The method of claim 38 wherein both the forward 
masking and the back-masking are in full echo reverber 
aton. 

40. The method of claim 37 wherein both the forward 
masking and the back-masking are in full echo reverber 
ation. 

41. An audio subliminal recording made by the 
method of claim 28. 

42. The method of claim 25 wherein the forward 
masking and the back-masking messages are different 
verbiage. 

43. The method of claim 25 wherein both the forward 
masking and the back-masking messages are the same 
verbiage. 

44. An audio subliminal recording made by the 
method of claim 25. 

45. The method of claim 28 wherein the forward 
masking statement is a round robin message. 

46. The method of claim 45 wherein the round robin 
message is a three repeat cycle. 

47. The method of claim 46 wherein each three repeat 
cycle comprises a man'voice, a woman's voice and a 
child's voice. 

48. The method of claim 47 wherein the forward 
masking is in full echo reverberation. 
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